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Introduction 

Today, more and more trade associations and professional societies compete in a global environment. In 
that context, they must comply not only with the United States antitrust laws, but also with the antitrust 
and competition laws of almost 100 countries throughout the world. Obviously, each trade association or 
professional society cannot be expected to have an in house staff antitrust specialist familiar with the 
entire gamut of international antitrust laws. However, trade associations and professional society senior 
staff members should have a clear understanding of basic antitrust and competition law requirements in 
the countries in which they have a presence and should have access to experienced antitrust counsel 
who can provide needed advice whenever antitrust sensitive issues arise. 

Antitrust in an International Setting 

In 1890, The United States Congress enacted the Sherman Antitrust Act. The purpose of this statute was 
to prevent large U.S. corporations from restraining competition by entering into agreements to fix prices 
and limit production. Congress wanted to protect free and open competition in the U.S. by prohibiting 
agreements to monopolize commerce between major companies. Initially, the Sherman Act was 
considered as the protector of both consumers and small business. Consumers were protected against 
agreements by sellers to artificially inflate the price of consumer goods. Small business was protected 
against attempts by big business to conspire to eliminate small businesses from the marketplace. 

Section 1 of the Sherman Act declared illegal "[e]very contract, combination in the form of trust or 
otherwise, or conspiracy, in restraint of trade or commerce among the several States, or with foreign 
nations ... " In the years after its enactment, this language did not change but the interpretation by the 
Courts of the meaning of that language, created a new body of law that certainly could not have been 
anticipated by legislators in 1890. 

As an example, the statute specifically prohibits "[e]very contract...in restraint of trade." Early on, the 
Courts decided that Congress did not intend the phrase "[e]very contract'' to mean "every contract." 
According to the Supreme Court, that phrase really meant: "every unreasonable contract." Thousands of 
pages have been written trying to differentiate between "reasonable" and "unreasonable" restraints on 
trade and how to measure the difference. This body of jurisprudence has created the antitrust concept 
called "the rule of reason." When a Court examines anti-competitive practices, one of the first issues is to 
determine whether the "rule of reason" applies and if so, what evidence is required to find that there is an 
antitrust violation. 

The Courts have recognized that some types of joint activities such as bid rigging, price fixing, customer 
allocation, market allocation and group boycotts are, on their face, so offensive as to be in antitrust terms, 
"per se" illegal. These activities are not subject to analysis under the rule of reason. Generally, all 
activities that are not in the "per se" category are subject to some type of rule of reason analysis. To make 
this analysis, each party to the litigation hires a team of economists to evaluate the practices and 
determine whether the economic effects are pro-competitive or anti-competitive. 

As time progressed, economists and the Courts began to decide cases in favor of practices that 
theoretically would promote economic efficiency and result in lower consumer prices. There was a 
general recognition that "big" was not necessarily "bad." Indeed, economists conclude that small 
competitors such as the neighborhood drug store, the small grocery store or the independent appliance 
store, were not economically efficient. Consumers could get better prices from large national sellers. As a 
result, the Courts started to permit industry consolidations and large national companies began to 
dominate every major marketplace. What started out as laws designed in part to protect small businesses 
from large competitors turned out to be laws that may have led to the demise of small businesses. 






